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Abstract 

The marketplace is where goods are bought and sold. The location of the market can 
occasionally be fascinating. Border markets are locations where global business transactions 
take place. In some exceptional circumstances, local authorities set the border market based 
on the friendly relations between the countries that share the border region. Even if there may 
not be any formal regulations, the international marketing is successfully controlled by 
harmonization and the most fundamental human relationships. 
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Introduction 

Market is the place for buying and selling. Sometimes, the market locates at an interesting 
place. Border market is a place that the international business exchange exists. In some 
extraordinary case, the border market is locally set based on peaceful relationship between 
nations that share the border area. There might be no official regulation but the 
harmonization, the basic primitive human relationship, successfully control the international 
marketing.  

Case study 

The case study is namely Zikaya city market. It locates at the border area between Maeramat 
District, Tak province, Thailand and Kayin State of Myanmar. In the summer, the local 
international market is set and the bamboo bridge is available for the local people to cross the 
border. There is no formal regulation. Many shops locates there and it is a famous tourist spot 
at that area. 
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Figure 1: Zikaya city market 

Discussion 

In order to reduce cross-border transaction costs and facilitate global trade and economic 
activity, a number of criteria are crucial [1]. In a setting where aid programs is playing a 
bigger part in the politics of borders, there is a special method in which the cross-border 
market is conceptualized [2]. Yet formality might not always be required. The foundational 
idea of humanity is harmony and peaceful coexistence. 

The international border market at a remote Indochina location is an example given in the 
current article. Even though there isn't a formal border rule, it may indicate that there is a 
calm and fruitful economic communication. The official is not horrible, but it occasionally 
causes problems because of things like numerous disagreements on borderline matters. 
Although the official is not awful, there can occasionally be conflict as a result of 
disagreements over borders that exist in many parts of the world. Although it may appear 
archaic to buy and sell in a harmonious and peaceful transaction, the practice has persisted up 
to the present and continues to function successfully. 
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